NA\{ARRO COUNfY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-A-001 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEQUS AUTO PARTS

)

VENDOR o . . RATE ; . Special Item Rates
B & G Auto Parts ) : : Wholesa!e or fleet brice‘
-_Corsicana7 Auto Parts . |Wholesale or better
O'Reilly Auto Parts ‘ List less 41%-or better -
All Autopart Bids Awarded

2026 Bid Tabs



NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR: Wilson Culverts
DIAMETER (inches) Gage
CULVERTS (price per linear foot)

12 16 $ 13.09 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15 16 $ 16.28 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18 16 $ 19.50 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24 16 $ 25.99 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30 16 $ 32.55 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36 16 $ 39.38 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42 16 $ 45.53 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48 14 $ 74,66 | 3" x 1" & §"x1" Corrugation
60 14 $ 91.99 | 3" x 1" & 5"x1" Corrugation
72 14 $ 111.19 | 3" x 1" & 5"x1" Corrugation
96 14 $ 146.63 | 3" x 1" & 5"x1" Corrugation

DELIVERY 10 Working Days

DMP BANDS (price each)
12" $19.63
15" $24.41
18" $29.25
24" $38.98
30" $48.83
36" $59.06
42" $136.58 Wide dimple band
48" $156.11 Wide dimple band
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE

12" 2-12" $ 184.76
15" 2-18" $ 284.32
18" 2-18" $ 403.50
24" 2-24" $ 617.96
30" 2 - 30" $ 883.66
36" 2 - 36" $ 1,220.62

DELIVERY 2-3 Weeks

CONTACT NAME Mason Huffins

CONTACT PHONE 903-764-5605

Contract awarded to:

2026 BID TAB CULVERTS



NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

ADVANCED DRAINAGE SYSTEMS, INC

BID IS EFFECTIVE 09/18/2025 - 09/19/2026

HP 20’
Qty UoMm item Number Description Unit Price | Amount
20 Foot | 126500201BPL1 12". HP DWALL STORM.WTIB,SOLID.20' $ 850 (|% 170.00
20 Foot | 15650020IBPL 15".HP DWALL STORM.WTIB.SOLID. 20' $§ 1209 (% 241.80
20 Foot | 186500201BL1 12".HP DWAL STORM.WTIB.SOLID. 20' $ 1640 | $ 328.00
20 Foot | 24650020IBEP1| 24".HP DWALL STORM.WTIB (EP).SOLID.20' [$ 2505| % 501.00
20 Foot [30650020I1BEP1| 30".EP DWALL HP STORM.WTIB.SOLID.20' $ 3846 |3 769.20
20 Foot | 366500201BPL1 36".HP DWALL STORM.WTIB.SOLID.20' $ 5145] % 1,029.00
20 Foot | 426500201BPL1 42".HP DWALL STORM.WTIB SOLID 20' $ 6378 [ $ 1,275.60
20 Foot | 48650020IBPL1 48".HP DWALL STORM.WTIB.SOLID.20' $ 8743 (% 1,748.60
20 Foot | 606500201BPL1 60".HP DWALL STORM.WTIB.SOLID20' $121.22 [ $ 2,424.40
HP 30°
Qty UOM Iltem Number Description Unit Price |  Amount
30 Foot 12950030PL 12".HP DWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $ 850|% 255.00
30 Foot 15950030PL 15". HP DWALL STORM.PL. SOLID.30' $ 1209 |9% 36270
30 Foot 18950030PL 18"HP DWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $ 1640 |9$ 492.00
30 Foot 24950030PL 24" HP DWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $ 2505|% 75150
30 Foot 30950030PL 30".HP DWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $§ 3846 | % 1,153.80
30 Foot 36950030PM 36".HP STORM.PL.30' $ 5145 | $ 1,543.50
30 Foot 42950030PL 42" HP DWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $ 6378 | % 1,913.40
30 Foot 48950030PL 48".HP DWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $ 8743 (% 2,622.90
30 Foot 60950030PL 60".HPDWALL STORM.PL.SOLID.30' $121.22 | $ 3,636.60
COUPLERS
Qty UOM ltem Number Description Unit Price | Amount
1 Each 1265AC 12".PREMIUM COUPLER W/O GASKET $ 913 ($ 9.13
1 Each 1565AC 15".PREMIUM COUPLER W/O GASKET $ 1520 (% 15.20
1 Each 1865AC 18".PREMIUM COUPLER W/O GASKET $ 2590 |% 2590
1 Each 2463AA 24".SPLIT COUPLER (3020H) $ 3653 |% 36.53
1 Each 3065AAEP 30".SPLIT COUPLER HP EP.(50/PALLET) $ 8491 (% 84901
1 Each 3661AA 36".SPLIT COUPLER - (50/PALLET) $ 11814 | $ 118.14
1 Each 4265AAHP 42".SPILT COUPLER HP STORM.(50/PALLET) | $ 17293 | $§ 172.93
1 Each 4865AA 48".SPLIT COUPLER.(25/PALLET) $20300|% 203.00
1 Each 6065AA 60".SPLIT COUPLER - (25/PALLET) $31578 | § 315.78

$2400 MINIMUM. $100 DROP FEE IF UNDER MINIMUM




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate Charge (Hr)
Vendor Barnto | Delive | pejivery
Company # of SightVen | ry |Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct#1 | Pct. #2 | Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
Gillen Trucking 1 day e
Danny Gillen | 15 or Uniimited | Bam to Site | Vanes | advance | '2 10" :’; bt NIA N/A NIA NIA N/A | $ 12500 [ $12500 | § 12500 | § 125.00 | 12500
903-641-2703 notice
Big Creek/Groesbeck 312:‘1 5_‘58' e 1300 | s 1050 | 8 12.00 13.00 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A
Knife River/Groesbeck “2:;;5_'5;’ e 13.00 | § 1050 | $ 12.00 13.00 NIA N/A NIA NIA N/A
Connors/Mexia $ 12361 i.sgf 145 1300 | § 1050 | § 12.00 13.00 N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA
Cemex/Blum ’1?;5::1 - 18.00 | § 18.50 | § 13.00 13.00 NIA NIA N/A NIA NIA
HMAT/Groesbeck - 13.00 | § 10.50 | § 12.00 13.00 NA | NoBid NIA N/A N/A
Martin Marietta/Corsicana $ 9.00 1000 | $ 900 | s 10.00 10.00 NIA NIA NIA NIA N/A
Texas BitMalakoft NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID noeio| noeio| noeno| w~osiD| nosio| NoBID
Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NoBD| NoeiD| NosiD| wNoei| NosiD|  NoBiD




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

—

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate Charge (Hr)
Vendor Barnto |Delive | pejivery
Company #of Sight'Ven | ry | Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct#1 | Pct. #2 | Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
Watson
Trucking Joey = : No min - No Max $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton
Wat Unlimited Bamto Site | Any NONE (Any) mile mile mile enlle iy $ 12500 | $12500 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00
254-205-2055
Big Creek/Groesbeck $ 1.75 1225 | § 9.00 | 10.00 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ § 125.00 | $ 12500 | § 125.00
Knife River/Groesbeck $ 1.75 1225 | § 900 | $ 10.00 12.00 | § 125.00 | $125.00 | $§ 12500 [ $ 12500 | $ 125.00
Connors/Mexia $ 12.00 12751 $ 990 | $ 10.75 1250 [ $ 125.00 | $12500 | § 12500 | § 12500 | $ 125.00
Cemex/Blum $ 17.50 21258 2050 § 15.50 1525 | $ 12500 | $12500 | § 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00
HMAT/Groesbeck $ 11.75 1250 | § 92518 10.25 1250 | $ 12500 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | § 125.00
Martin Marietta/Corsicana $ 7.00 925 (8 7008 10.00 12.00 [ $ 12500 | $12500 | $ 12500 [ $ 125.00 | § 125.00
Texas Bit/Malakoff (Hot Mix) $ 11.50 700 | $ 1200 | $ 14.00 1250 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00 | § 125.00
|
|
Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix) $ 7.00 975 |$ 700 |8 10.00 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $12500 | § 125.00 | § 125.00 ( $ 125.00




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate
Vendor Barnto | Delive | pejivery
Company # of Sight'Ven | ry |Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct #1 | Pct. #2 | Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
Roads
Transportation T -
Group Nicole 10+ Bam to Site 2::5 none | 2 :g:s”,;"um s 925 | § 925 |8 925 | s 925 | s 9.25 |5 12500 | $12500 | § 12500 | $ 12500 | § 125.00
White
936-577-1573
Big Creek/Groesbeck $ 950 | $ 950 | 950§ 950 | $ 9.50 | $ 125.00 | $12500 | § 12500 | § 125.00 | § 125.00
Knife River/Groesbeck s 950 | $ 950 | $ 950 | $ 950 |8 950 | $ 12500 [ $12500 [ $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00 | § 125.00
Connors/Mexia $ 10.00 | § 1000 | § 1000 | § 10.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 125.00 | $12500 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | § 125.00
Cemex/Blum $ 16.00 | § 16.00 | § 16.00 | $ 16.00 [ $ 16.00 | $ 12500 | $12500 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | § 125.00
HMAT/Groesbeck $ 10,00 | § 10.00 | $ 10.00 | § 1000 | $ 10.00 | § 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00 [ $§ 125.00
Martin Marietta/Corsicana $ 925§ 925|8 925|% 8253 925 $ 12500 | $12500 | § 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00
Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix) $ 1300 | § 1300 | $ 13.00 | § 1300 | $ 1300 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 | § 12500 | $ 12500 [ $ 125.00




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Fiat Rate Charge (Hr)
Vendor P Barn to | Delive | pejivery
Company # of Sight/'Ven | ry | Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct #1 | Pct. #2 | Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
D & T Services )
DanaMicks | Unlimited | BamtoSie | Varies | NoNg |2010nSMin-251ns | ¢ 1200 | s 18.00 | $ 1025 | $ 1226 1200 [ $ 12500 | NOBID |3 9500 (s 9500 125.0
254-715-9718
Big Creek (Groesbeck) $ 12,00 | § 18.00 | § 10258 12.25 12.00 | $ 12500 | NOBID | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $§ 125.00
Knife River (Groesbeck) $ 1200 | § 18.00 | § 1025 | § 12.25 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 [ § 125.00
$13
Connors (Mexia) “PCT1.|$ 18.00 | $ 10.25 | § 12.25 12.00 | § 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00
(Whitney) $15
Cemex (Blum) $ 1520 | $ 1750 | § 1750 | § 12.25 12.50 [ $ 12500 | NOBID [ § 12500 | § 12500 | $ 125.00
HMAT (Groesbeck) H 13.00 | $ 18.00 | § 10.25 | § 1225 1200 [ $ 12500 | NOBID | $ 12500 | $ 12500 [ $ 125.00
Martin Marietta (Corsicana) H 750 | $ 900 |$ 9.00 | S 10.00 800 | $ 12500 | $125.00 | § 12500 | § 12500 [ § 125.00
Texas Bit {Hot Mix - Malako#f) [ 12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | § 125.00 | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID
Big Creek (Hot Mix - Corsicana) 3 1000 | § 18.00 | § 1050 | § 12.25 1200 | $ 125.00 | NOBID | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | § 125.00




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID NO. 2026-R-004 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ROAD AND BASE MATERIALS BID TABULATION

(Matarial picked up at pitiplant) HOT OIL HOT MIX CATIONIC |FLEXBASE| FLEX TYPE"C* | TYPE'D" PEA Dirty (s?.TH"Ei‘!“
VENDOR LOCATION SAND HOTMIX | COLDLAID | EMULSION A2 | BASEA2/2| WASTE ROCK ROCK 3/8 Type O | GRAVEL Rock Balow)
Martin Marietta Corsicana 35.00 35.00 47,00 43.00 |
Conners Construction, INC Honest Ridge 11.00 9.50 T}
Arcosa Aggregates Terrell TX 23.00 m
Big Ci h n Dallas TX 15,00 17.00
E Emulsi | Austin TX $95.00 v
| Blades Group Uvalde TX Y]
Knife River Waco TX 78.00 130.00 13.00 13.00 Vi
Helmcamp Materials Buffalo TX 12.50 12.50 11.50 Vi
Kin Grav: Athens TX 15.00 65.50 55 85
PCT.1 MATERIAL DELIVERED
Martin Maretta Corsicana 41.75 41.75 53.75 49.75
Conner's Construction Honest Ridge
Arcosa Aggregates Terrell TX
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas TX 37.50 37.50
Ergon Asphalt Austin TX 645.00
Blades Group Uvalde TX
Knife River Waco TX 105.00 157.00 37.00 37.00
Helmcamp Materials Buffalo TX
King Sand & Gravel Athens TX 30.00 75.50 65.85
PCT.2 MATERIAL DELIVERED
Martin Marietta Corsicana 41,75 4175 5375 4975
jon Honest Ridge
Terrell TX
ig Ci te Dallas TX 40.00 40,00
i Austin TX 645.00
| Blades Group Uvalde TX
Knife River Waco TX 109.00 161.00 39.00 39.00
Heimcamp Materials Buffalo TX
i vel Athens TX 75, 65.85
PCT.3 MATERIAL DELIVERED
Martin Marietta Corsicana 41.75 41.75 53.75 49.75
Conner's Construction Honest Ridge Tx
Arcosa Aggregates Temell Tx
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas TX 40.00 40.00
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Austin TX 645.00
Blades Group Uvalde TX
Knife River Waco TX 101.00 153.00 36.00 36.00
Heimcamp Materials Buffalo TX
King Sand & Gravel Athens TX 30.00 75.50 65.85
PCT.4 MATERIAL DELIVERED
Martin Marietta Corsicana 41.75 41.75 53.75 4975
Conner's Construction Honest Ridge Tx
Arcosa Aggregates Terrall TX
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas TX 37.50 37.50
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions | Austin TX 645.00
Blades Group Uvaide TX 40.00
Knife River Waco TX 105.00 157.00 40.00
Helmcamp Materials Buffale TX
King Sand & Gravel Athens TX 30.00 75.50 65.85

Other Products offered are on last page. Prices shown are per ton unless otherwise specified.




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID NO. 2026-R-004 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ROAD AND BASE MATERIALS BID TABULATION

OTHER
{Material picked up at pit/plant) HOT OiL HOT MIX CATIONIC | FLEX BASE FLEX TYPE “C* TYPE "D PEA Dirty (Ses Notes
VENDOR LOCATION SAND HOT MiX COLD LAID | EMULSION Az BASE A/2/2| WASTE ROCK ROCK 3/8 Type D GRAVEL Rock Below)

I. Martin Marietta, Inc

Corsicana Plant

1 Inch "Granite” - $57 per ton Material only /$63.75 per ton applied for each pct,

Il. Conners Construction Lott Tx Standard Road Base $9.50
2513 US Hwy 77
Lott, TX 76656
254-584-2011
Iil. Arcosa Aggregates Terrell TX 1 3/4” Minus Utility Rock - Recycled Concrete - $31/ton. Picked up yard
401 I-45 Frontage Rd. Dirty Rock - Oversized Construction Entrance Rock Recycled Concrete - $31/ton picked up yard
Ferris TX 75125 Recycled Asphalt - $20/ton picked up at yard
817-307-7394
IV. Ergon Asphalt Austin TX This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of material is not ordered
Pump & hose is $100 per load. Demurrage is billed at $100 per hr, after the second hour.
Return freight is one-half of the common carrier’s outgoing tariff rate.
Federal Enviromental fee will be added to bid prices @ a rate of $0.00150/gal for emulsion loads or $019770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads.
This fee is not included in the bid price.
For equip. ordered but not used (loads not cancelled in timely manner), the carrier may charge up to $400 cancelled fee paid by customer.
V. Blades Group Uvalde TX Item 330 Type1 GradeD. 50Ib bags, 1 cubic yard supersack & bulk.
Material only PCT.1 $227.03 - W. Hwy 31, Dawson Tx
Material only - PCT.2 $236.01 - W. Hwy 31. Kerens Tx
Material only - PCT.3 $227.03 - S. Austin Ave. Richland Tx
Material only - PCT.3 $230.44 - W. Hwy 31. Dawson Tx
Material only - PCT.4 $226.72 - Blooming Grove
V1. Knife River Waco TX PCT. 3 - Richland - Hot Mix - $106 per ton
2901 Marlin Hwy 6 PCT. 3 - Richland - Hot Mix/Cold laid - $158 per ton
Waco TX 76705 PCT. 3 - Richland - Flex Base A/1/2 - $30 per ton
979-219-3574 PCT. 3 - Richland - Flex Base A/2/2 - $30.00 per ton
Vii. Helmcamp Materials |Groesbeck TX Material Only
P.O. Box 456
Buffalo TX 75831

903-626-5911




